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SCRE Project No. AM20{7-002C

Shelby County Government

Lee Harris
Mavor September 18, 2018

Mr. Rand Bouldin, MAIL SRA, AI-GRS, CCIM
Bouldin and Associates

P.O. Box 172025

Memphis. TN 38187

Re: NOTICE TO PROCEED WITH REAL ESTATE APPRAISALS
Project Name: HUD Resiliency Grant Project — Wolf River Greenway Trail, Phase No. 06

Project Location: Hollywood St. to Douglas Park
Subject Properties: Tract Nos, 02, 08, 10, 12,13, 14, 18, 19, 20, 21, 23, 24, 28,29 & 30
Project No. 3-NDR-07  Purchase Order No. PO32117

Dear Mr. Bouldin,

Thanks for your fee quote bid submitted to do the Appraisals of the proposed acquisitions across the
above referenced properties in response to Shelby County Government's 05/30/18 request for such fee quote bids.
This is to nolify you that based upon your submitted bid Shelby County Government has selected you to do these
Appraisals. Shelby County has also selected Wade and Associates to do the Review Appraisals.

According to your bid, you will provide the above described appraisal services for a total fee of
$47,700.00.

On behalf of Shelby County Government, please accept this letter as your “Notice to Proceed”
immediately with this appraisal assignment. Should you need additional information relevant to this appraisal
assignment, please call me at 222-2576. Upon completion of this appraisal assignment, please include on your
invoices Project No. 3-NDR-07 and Purchase Order No. P032117 for payment processing. On behalf of
Shelby County Government, thank you in advance for your involvement on this project!

Best Regards,

Tkl

Bill Goss, Manager
Real Estale Services
Shelby County Government

Ce: Dawn Kinard
Darren Sanders
Tom Needham
Jim Vazquez
Kevin Eason
Jason Morris

584 Adams Avenue + Memphis, Tennessee 38103 « (901) 222-2576 + Fax {901)222-2518

Email: william.gossishelbyeountym.gov



Vazquez, Jim

Gass, Bill <william.Goss@sheibycountytn.gov>

Fram:

Sent: Friday, August 24, 2018 3:36 PM

To: Rand Bouldin

Cc: Vazquez, Jim; Kizer, Edward: Needham, Tom; Kinard, Dawn; Steve Tacker (sltacker2005
@bellsouth.net)

Subject: RE: HUD Resiliency Grant Project-Wolf River Greenway Trail; Phase No. 06 -Tract Nes.
02,08,10,12,13,14,18,19,20,21,23,24,28,29 & 30 [15 tracts] - SCRE File No. AM2017-002C

Importance: High

Good afterncon Mr. Bouldin,

This emait is being senl to confirm my receipt of your resubmitted bid to appraise Tracts 02, 08, 10, 12, 13, 14, 18, 15,
20, 21, 23, 24,28, 29 & 30 on the above reference project for the total fee of $47,700.00. Your resubmitted bid reduced
the number of tracts 1o be appraised from your original submitted bid on 06/11/18 from 20 tracts to 15 tracts with your
total fee being reduced accordingly from $63,500.00 to $47,700.00. At this time your resubmitied bid will supersede
and replace your originally submitted bid on 06/11/18 for approval processing.

Thank you for your willingness and availahility to assist Shelby County Government with these appraisals. Assoon as
your resubmitted bid is approved and a purchase Order is issued, you may proceed with these appraisals.

Best Regards,

Bill Goss, Manager

Real Estate Services

Shelby County Government

584 Adams Avenue

Memphis, TN 38103

E-mail: William.Gossabshelbyveounivin.goy
Phone: {901) 222-2576

Fax: {901) 222-2518

E&% Please do not print this e-nrnd gileds aeeessary

Notice: This message is confidential, is intended only for the na
exempt from disclosure under applicable law. if you are not the
or copying of this message is strictly prohibited. If you received

your computer.

From: Rand Bouldin [maiito:rbmai@belisouth.net]
Sent: Friday, August 24, 2018 12:25 PM

To: Goss, Bill

Subject: RE: Request for Bids

med recipieni(s) and may contain information that is privileged or
intended recipient(s), you are notified that the disseminatior, distribution
this message and are not an intended recipient, please delete it from

Bilf,

Based on our verbal conversation, it is my understanding that you now need a guote on completing appraisals of Tracts
02,08 10,12, 13, 14, 18,19, 20, 21, 23, 24, 28,29 & 30.

The total fee for these appraisals would be $47,700.

The time frame would be 3 weels or less.

Let me know if you have any questions.

Thank you,



Rand

Rand Bouldin, MAlL SRA, Al-GRS, CCIM
Bouldin and Associates

(901) 766-1880 - office

www bouldinandassociates.com

From: STEVE TACKER [mailto:sttacker 2005 @bellsouth.net]

Sent: Wednesday, May 30, 2018 3:45 PM

To: |. Walter Allen <wallen@irr.com>; tames O. Turner i <fimturner@irr
<jwade @wadeappraisal.com>; Rand Bouldin <rhmai@belisouth.net>; Douglas B. Haill CRE MAI
elashallmai@eomeast.net>; Mark Jjohnstone <mark@johnstenegroup.net>; Eric Trotz

com>; James Wade

<otrotz@irotzrealestate.com>
Cc: Bill Goss <willizin goss@shelbycountyln.gov>; Dawn Kinard <dawn.kinard@@shelbycountyin.gove

Subject: Request for Bids

RE: SHELBY COUNTY PROJECT#AM2017-002C

Dear Real Estate Appraiser Vendors,

The purpose of this emalil is to formally invite you to submit a bid via email for providing the following
described appraisal services needed by Shelby County Government in conjunction with the above

referenced project:

1 A Formal Summery Appraisal of the Real property rights to be acquired on Tract Nos.
2810,12.13,14,18.19,20,21,23,24,28,29,30,31 32.33,34,&35 [20 tracts] of the above referenced Wolf
River Trail project, including a narrative report provided for each, in duplicate, conforming to the
following- Title Il of the Uniform Relocation Assistance and Real Estate Property Acquisition Policies
Act of 1970, as amended to-date (Uniform Act); Uniform Standards of Professional Appraisal Practice
(USPAP): and TDOT Appraisal Guidelines. This quote must be based upon your ability/commitment {o
complete this entire appraisal assignment and deliver all of the narrative reports to the County within
forty-five (45) calendar days from the receipt of the County's notice to proceed with these appraisals.
(The County plans to select/commission the successful bidder and issue its notice to proceed with
these appraisals on 6/11/2018 with the appraisal completion deadline being 07/26/2018).

2. A Review Appraisal of the Formal Summary Appraisal covering the Real Property

Rights to be acquired for Tract Nos. 2 8.1012,13,14,18,19,20,21,23,24,28,29,30,31, 32,33,34.&35
(20 tracts] on the above referenced Wolf River Trail project, including a narrative report provided for
each tract, in duplicate, conforming to the following - Title 11l of the Uniform Relocation Assistance and
Real Property Acquisition Policies Act of 1970, as amended to-date (Uniform Act); Uniform Standards
of Professional Appraisal Practice (USPAPY); and TDOT Appraisal Guidelines. This quote must be

2



based upon your ability/commitment to complete this entire review appraisal assignment and detiver
all of the narrative reports to the County within thirty days (30) calendar days from the receipt of the
Formal Summary Appraisal for such tracts. (The County plans to select/commission the successful
bidder and issue its notice to proceed with these review appraisals on 07/26/2018; the Formal
summary Appraisals for all of the subject tracts will be scheduled for delivery to the Review Appraiser
on or before 07/26/2018 with the review appraisal completion deadline being 08/27/2018).

In order to be considered for either of the above described appraisal assignments, your bid,
via email for providing the above described appraisal services must be received by Monday,
06/11/2018 at 4:00 p.m. In the event you decide not to submit a bid, please do send me an

email confirming that no bid will be forthcoming.

The attached files contain individual acquisition plats of the subject tracts showing the Real Property
rights to be acquired. Files showing the construction plans for this project will be sent to you under
separate emails due to their size Let me know if you have any questions or need additional information
in order for you to develop your quotes. On behalf of Shelby County Government, thank you for your

interest in providing appraisal services for the County.

Best Regards,

Steve Tacker,
Right of Way Consultant for
Shelby County Government
901-378-0923
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Goss, Bill s
From: STEVE TACKER <sltacker2005@belisouth.net>
Sent: Tuesday. June 12, 2018 3:48 PM
To: Rand Bouldin; James Wade
Cc: Goss, Bill; Kinard, Dawn
Subject: Phase 6 Wall River Trail

and. you arc the low bidder for the MDB and Summery Appraisals: Jack. you

Rand-Jack- Congratulations...R
a day late in getting the

are the low bidder for the Reviews. [ will be adding a day to the schedule because [ am
award out. 'l email vou both back tomoerow.

Thanks for your participation!

Steve
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Goss, Bill

From: STEVE TACKER «<sltacker2005@bellsouth net>
Sent: Thursday, August 16, 2018 2:30 PM

To: Goss, Bil

Subject: Fw: Request for Bids

Attachmenis: Bouldin-WRC Greenway Proposal pdf

Abpet> wrote:

On Monday, June 11, 2018 12:11 PM, Rand Bouldin <1

Steve,

| have attached my proposal. As noted in the proposal, | have completed werk on the Woif River Greenway in

the pasl.

The total fee for the appraisals would be $83,500.
The total fee for the reviews would be $53,300.

We will work under the time frame requested. However, please be aware that these types of appraisals
sometimes result in delays beyond our control due to plans revisions or dealings with property owners.
Also. the review fee assumes that the appraisals will be performed by an appraiser experienced in this type of

appraisal work.

Let me know if you have any questions.

Thank you,
Rand

Rand Bouldin, MAI, SRA. AI-GRS, CCIM
Bouldin and Associates

(601) 766-1880 - office

(801) 766-1881 - fax

LS
GRS

From: STEVE TACKER [maillo sfiacker2005@belisoui net

Sent: Wednesday, May 30, 2018 3:45 PM

To: J. Walter Allen <wzilen@ir com>; James O. Turner I} <jimuwrner@ir com>; James Wade

< waceibwadesppraisal com™>; Rand Bouldin <rbmai@belisouth nel>; Douglas B. Hall CRE MA/
<dougiashalimad@comeast.net> Mark Johnstone <mark@chnsienearoup net>; Eric Trotz
<gtrolz@irotzreaslestate com>

Ce: Bill Goss <wiliam goss@snelbyeountyin goy>, Dawn Kinard <dawn kinsrof@shelbyoountvin gov>

Subject: Request for Bids

RE: SHELBY COUNTY PROJECT=ZAM2017-002C

—




Dear Real Estate Appraiser Vendors,

The purpose of this email is to formally invite you to submit a bid via email for providing the following
described appraisal services needed by Shelhy County Government in conjunction with the abuve referenced

project:

I A Formal Summery Appraisal of the Real property rights to be acquired on Tract Nos.
TR L0213.014.08.19.20.21.23.24.28.29.30.31.32.33.34,&35 {20 tracts] of the above referenced Wolf River
Trail project, including a narrative report provided for each. in duplicate. conforning to the following- Title M
of the Uniform Relocation Assistance and Real Estate Property Acquisition Policies Act of 1970, as amended
to-date (Uniform Act); Uniform Standards of Protessional Appraisal Practice (USPAP); and TDOT Appraisal
Guidelines. This quote must be based upon your ability:commitment to complete this entire appraisal
assignment and deliver all of the narrative repoits to the County within forty-five (45) calendar days from the
receipt of the County's notice to proceed with these appraisals. (The County plans to select/‘commission the
suceessful bidder and issue its notice to proceed with these appraisals on 6112018 with the appraisal
completion deadline being 07:26/2018).

2. A Review Appraisal of the Formal Summary Appraisal covering the Real Property

Rights to be acquired for Tract Nos. 2.8,10.12.13,14.18.19.20.21,23.24.28.29,30,31, 32.33.34 &35 [20

tracts] on the above referenced Wolf River Trail project, including a narrative report provided for each tract, n
duplicate, conforming to the following - Title 11 of the Uniform Relocation Assistance and Real Property
Acquisition Policies Act of 1970, as amended to-date (Uniform Act); Uniform Standards of Professional
Appraisal Practice (USPAPY, and TDOT Appraisal Guidelines. This quote must be based upon your
ability’commitment to complete this entire review appraisal assignment and deliver ali of the narrative reports
to the County within thirty days (20) calendar days from the receipt of the Formal Summary Appraisal tor such
tracts. {The County plans to select-commission the successtul bidder and issuc its notice to proceed with these
review appraisals on 07 26/2018: the Formal Summary Appraisals tor all of the subject tracts will be scheduled
for delivery to the Review Appraiser on ar before 07:26.2018 with the review appraisal completion deadline
being 08.27.2018).

In order to be considered for either of the above described appraisal assignments, your bid, via email for
providing the above described appraisal services must be received by Monday, 06/11/2018 at 4:00 p.m. In
the event vou decide not to submit a bid, please do send me an email confirming that no bid will be

forthcoming.

The attached files contain individual acquisition plats of the subject tracts showing the Real Property rights
he acquired. Files showing the construction plans for this project will be sent to you under separate emails due
to their size Let me know if vou have any questions or need additional information in order tor you to develop
your quotes. On behalf of Shelby County Government. thank vou for your interest in providing appraisal

services for the County.

Best Regards,

Steve Tacker,
Right of Way Consultant for
Shelby County Government




901-378-0923




Bouldin & Associates

P.O. Box 172025
Memphis, Tennessce 38187
Phone (981) 766-1 886

Fav (9} 7e6- 1881

Fmail: rthmaww bellsouth.net Rand Bouldin, MAL SRA. ALGRS. CCIM

June 11, 2018
To: Steve Tacker

Rer  Coat Proposal
Appraisal and Review Appraisal Services
Wolf River Greenway
Shelby County, TN

In response to vour request, 1 am providing a cost proposal for appraisal services and
review appraisal services for the easement acquisitions for the Wolf River Greenway.  The list
of tracts. proposed types of appraisals, and fee for cach tract are provided on the following pages.

I have also enclosed the following documentation:
Last of projects i the fastew scars

State license
Qualifiations

st b —

I hine vast experence in completing appraisal work for right-of-way and easenient
acquisition | am an approved appraiser for the Tennessee Departisent of Transportation. 1 have
Deen imvolved inomany projects in West Tennessee. T oalso complete appraisals for Shelby
County. MLG&W. and the cities of Memphis, Germantown, Bartlett, Collierville, Srlinglon,

[akeland. Millington. and Piperton.

I regularly complete all tvpes of appraisal work m the Memphis Metropolitan area and
surrounding Jocations. | haye been performing appraisals in the Memphis arca throughout my
carcer. e previousls completed appraisals for the Woll River Greenw ay

AL appratsal services and documents will be peovided in accordance with apphicable
guidelines and requirements, All services wili adhere o Title VI requurements,

I will be the only appraiser who wilt directly work on this assignment.  Thus, Shelby
County and other entities invelved in this project will be dealing directly with me and not with
Iraines.

The 1pe of appraisal (Formal or FPAY projected for each bact s based on my review of
the plans. The proposed fees asswme that the type of appraisal needed for that tact does not
change. it s determined that the type ol appraisal Toe any particular tract shouid be alered,
then the foe for that tract will be altered aceordingly,




Rund Banldos, A4l SRA A-GRS. CCIM

Bouldin & Associates S

Any additional work outside of the normal appraisal process for completing the
appraisals will be hased on our typical hourly rate. This rate wili apply to any work tollowing
completion of the original appraisal reports.  The time billed for expert witness services, if
needed. will include preparation, travel, deposition. testimony, and any other time incurred as a

result of the request for expert witness services.

Based on the current list of appraisals needed for the project, the fees are provided in the

table on the following page.

et me know il you have any questions concerning this fee proposal.

Thank you,

-~

Rand Bouldin, MAL SRA. AI-GRS, CCIM
State Certified General Real Estate Appraiser
No, CG-a45

Contact Information:

Rand Bouldin. MAL SRA, A[-GRS. CCIM
P.O. Box 172025

Memphis, TN 38187

(9011 766-18%0 {office)

{901) 766-1881 itux)

rbmaiii betlsouth.net



Rund Bowddin, A1) SRA AI-GRS CCIAL

FEE PROPOSAL
Tract Number 2 Owner Appraisal Type Appraisal Fee | Review Fee
- Stlas and Barbara Reed Formal Part Affected 1 5 §2.500 §2.4400
8 | Tilinois Cengral Railroad Formal $3.600 $2.900
10 City of Memplas and Formal Part Affected $2.900 L2400
Shefby County |
R T LQE“ N Formal Part Aftected $3.400 $2,600
13 . Humphries Formal S3.R800 LU0
14 ¢ (anadsan Nahonal Format Part Attected $3.400 $2.900
e Raload
15 Norman Marny 5 Formai $3.2040 $2.800
149 o Cartand Terry Smith Formal Part Affected 2200 $2.000
20 ¢ Health and Educational Formal Parl Affecied S3.R00 $31.200
i ltousing
5y Marv S, Norman Format £3.200 S2AG0
r 23 FMary Norman : Formal $3.400 $2.800
! 24 | Kenneth M. Scruggs Formal ' $3200 4 82800
2% Mary Norman . _ Formal 52,90 $2.600
29 ClitTord Robinsen Formal l 52,800 £2.600
k1] - Fddic and Jettie Robinson Formal $2.900 $2.600
3i L ee and Corrine Reed Fonna! Pan AfTected 52.900 52400
12 Charles and Vera Stinson Uormat Pant Affected §1.900 32400
L 33 : Carolyn Pratcher . Formal Pann Affected 52,809 $£2.400
i Caralyrn Walker and Formal Part Affected 2800 $2,400
) - Shevell Pratcher I
15 " John Waddcll Formal Pan Affected } $4.400 $3,600
Total | $63,500 | §53,300




DATE [MMWODYYYY}

®
ACORD CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE - 08/11/2018
e TFICAT S 1S5UE AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLEER THIS
Y AMEND, EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES

CERTIFICATE DOES NQOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVEL
BELOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(S) AUTHORIZED

REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER,
IMPORTANT: I the certificate holder |8 an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the policy{ies) must be endorsad, it SUBROGATION 1S WAIVED, subjact to
the terms and condlitions of the policy, cartaln policies may require an gndarsement, A statemant on this certlficate doas not confer rights to the

certiftcate holder in Heu of such endarsement(s).

TONACTRICHARD

FRODUCER
MIKE FAY / STATE FARM TPHONE " "951.682-8700 FTE g 901-682-8712
Statefarm 6263 POPLAR AV SUITE 407 o MIKE@CALLMIKEFAY.COM
@@ MEMPHIS TN 38118 INSURER{S) AFFORDING COVERAGE RAIC &
’ InsuRER A Stale Farm Fire ano Casuaity Company 25143
NS URED BOULDIN, EARL RANDLE isuRER B ;Slate Farm Mutuel Autornabils Insurance Gompany 25178
DBA BOULDIN ASSCC INSURER € ;
1850 POPLAR CREST CV STE 103 INSURER D ;
MEMPHIS TN 381194800 | INSURER €
INSURER F : i
COVERAGES CERTIFICATE NUMBER: ' REVISION NUMBER:
EEN ISSUED TO THE INSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERIOD

THIS 1S TO CERTIFY THAT THE POLICIES CF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE B
NY CONTRACT OR OTHER DOGUMENT WITH RESPECT TO WHICH THIS

INDICATED. NOTWITHSTANDING ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM QR GONDITION OF A
ORDED BY THE POLICIES DESCRIBED HEREIN 18 SUBJECT TO ALt THE TERMS,

GERTIFICATE MAY BE {SBUED OR MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANCE AFF
AY HAVE BEEN REDUCED BY PAID CLAIMS.

EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH POLICIES. LIMITS SHOWN WL
MR 550 POUSYEFE | POLICY EAF
i TYPE OF INSURANCE ISR WYD POLICY NUMBER mgi‘bz)r(%ﬂ ORI Y] LIMTS
A COMMERCIAL GEHERAL LIABWITY Y A EACH OCCURRENCE s 1,000,000
|1 VANAGE
] CLAMS-MADE I N l OCCUR _ERE e sacumencay | 8 300,000
BUSINESS OFFICE
B3 — 92.-GA-2588-3 01162018 | 01-16-2019 [MECEXP (Any ovepersan) L § §.000
. PERSONAL & ADVINJURY | 3 1,000,000
GENL AGOREGATE LIMIT APPLIES PER: GENERAL AGGREGATE ] 2.000,000
R
soucy | 155y | iac PRODLCTS - COMPIOR AGG | § 1,000,000
OTHER 5
B | AUTOMOBLE LIABILITY Yv 146 2081-002420 04022018 | 04-02-2019 | LaainED OUE LM g
ANY AUTO BODILY INJURY {Fer persenty | § 1,000,908
[ ! e —
AL GYNEO % SCHEDULED SQDILY INJURY {Per nccidsal | § 1,000,000
NCN ED RIPE
X | irenacros || Aotos o s ery RO 5 +000,000
! s
UMBRELLALIAB OCCUR EACH QCCURRENCE $
EXCESS LA CLAIMS-MADE AGGREGATE $
ofo || RETENTIONS N
"WORKERS COMPENSATION BEi j OTH-
(ANO EMPLOYERS' LIABILITY YN STATUTE ER
ANY PROPRISTORIPARTNEREXKECUTIVE i o
CF FICERMTMAER EXGLUDES? INCA EL. EACH ACCIOENT 3
{Mandatory In NH) £ DISEASE -EA EMPLOYEE, $
;'1‘\;:9!‘ gascrine unger
DESERIPTION OF OPERATIDNS bekow EL DISEASE - POLICY LIMIT 1 §

101, Addlitional Remarke Senodule, may be autached if mone 3pace Is raqulined}

DESCRIPTION OF GPERRTIONS / LOCATIONS ! VEHICLES (ACORD
and members of boards, agencies, and commissicns are additional insureds with

Shelby County Goverment, its elected officials, appointees, employees
respect to lizbitily coverage.

CERTIFICATE HQOLDER CANCELLATION

Shelby County Government SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIGED POLICIES BE CANGELLED BEFORE

584 Adams Avenue THE EXPIRATION CATE THEREOQF, NOTICE WiLl BE DELIVERED W
ACCORDANGE WITH THE POLICY PROVISIONS.

Memphis, TN 38103

mmm /gww%
[ad

1
@ 1988-2014 ACORD CORPQORATION. All rights reserved.
The AGCORD name and loge are registered marks of ACORD 1001466 132849.9 02-04-2014

ACORD 26 {2014/01)




DATE (MBUDOYYYY)

N e
ACORD CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE - 0511172018

THIS CERTIFICATE (S ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS
TIVELY AMEND, EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES

CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGA

BELOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF (NSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(S), AUTHORIZED
REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE GERTIFIGATE HOLDER,
TMPORTANT. 1 the cartificate holder Ts an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the
the terms and conditions of the policy, certaln policles may requlre an en

Tolicy{fos) must be endorsed. if SUBROGATION IS WAIVED, subject to
dorsemant. A slatement on this centificate doas not confar rights to the

certiflcata holdes in liou of such gndarsemant{s}.
PROTUCER CENTALTRICHARD
MIKE FAY / STATE FARM ' PHONE . §01-682-8700 FRE no001-682-8712
StateFarm 6263 POPLAR AV SUITE 407 i MIKE@CALLMIKEFAY.COM ]
Q@O MEMPHIS TN 38119 INSURER|5] AFFORDING COVERAGE NAIG B
* \NSURER A :State Farm Fire and Casualty Company 28143
"NSURED BGULDIN, EARL RANDLE MSURER b :Stale Farm Mutual Automobile Insurance Company 24178
DA BOULDIN ASSOC (NSURER G :
1850 POPLAR CREST CV STE 103 | INSURER D ; ]
MEMPHIS TN 381194800 INSURER E :
INSURER £ :
COVERAGES CERTIFICATE NUMEER: ] REVISION NUMBER:
D NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERIODR

THiS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE FOLICIES OF INSURANGE LISTED EELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE INSURE
INDICATED. NOTWATHSTANDING ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM OR GONDITION OF ANY CONTRACT OR OTHER O
CERTIFICATE MAY BE {SSUED GR MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANCE AFFGRDED BY THE POLICIES DESCRIBED H

OCUMENT WITH RESPECT TO WHICH THIS
EREIN IS SUBJECT TO ALL THE TERMS,

£XCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH POLIGIES. LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDUCED BY PAID CLAIMS
75| ABBLEUBR
iy TYPE OF INSURANGE Wyh POLICY NUMBER Ewcv o 553%%%: LTS
A COMMERCIAL GENERAL LABRITY Y Y EACH OCCURRENCE [3 4,000,000
— ) - SAVAGE YO RENYED
| cuamsaane || ocour FREWMISES {E8 ateumencer {3 300,000
BUSINESS OFFICE
X 92.GA-2586-3 01-16-2018 | 01-16-201g | MEQEXP hry oneporseny & 5040
... PERSONAL & ADV INJURY 13 1,006,000
GENL AGGREGATE LINIT AFPLIES PER: GENERAL AGGREGATE 3 2.009,000
POLICY i s Loc FRODUCTS -COMP/OP AGG | 8 1,000.000
QTHER: $
| FUTONOBLE LABLITY Y|y 146 2081-D02420 04072018 | 04.02-2018 | G ponn o 18 ]
ANY AJTQ BOTRLY INJURY (Per person) | § 1,000.000
Q'—U‘-Tg‘g\“m X %ﬁgga:::; BODILY INJURY {Per becidant)] $ 1 000,000
[ FROBERTY LA
X | virgo autos i R oy MAoE s 1,090,000
| H
UMBRELLA LIAB OCCUR EACH OCCURRENCE $
EXCESS LIAD CLAIMS-MADE AGOREGATE 3
ofn | | netenions - 3
WORKERS COMPENSATION R Qre-
Kmo ENPLOYERS' LLABIITY vint [Etkrure [ LEn
ANY PROPRIETORIFARTNEWEXECUTIVF. i E
H P FICBRMEMIER EXCLUDED? HiA E.L EACH ACCIDENT L
{Mandatary in NH) E.L DISEASE - £A EMPLOYEE
!!1 o4 describe unger
TDESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS below £L OISEASE - POLICY LIMIT } 3

01, Addltiona!l Remarks Schedule, mey ba atteched If mere space {8 required}

DESCRIFTION GF OPERATIONS / LOCATIONS [ VEHICLES (ACORD 1
rers of boards, agencies, and commisslons are additionai insureds wilh

Sheiby County Govemment, its elected officials, appointees, employees and ment
respect {o liabliily coverage.

CERTIFICATE HOLDER CANCELLATION
Shelby County Government SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE
584 Adams Avenue THE ENPIRATION DATE THEREQF, NOTICE Wil BE DELIVERED N
ACCORDANGE WiTH THE POLICY FROVISIONS,

Memphis, TN 38103
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